
A First Time for Everything by Dan Santat 

1. In which book did a character go on a plane for the first time and have his first broken 
heart? 

2. In which book did a boy help a character who had been sleepwalking? p. 126 

3. In which book did characters dance together during an outdoor concert? p. 257 

4. In which book were characters allowed to explore Paris alone for the afternoon? p. 73 

5. In which book did a character ride on the world’s largest Ferris wheel with his teacher? 
p. 253 

 

Bea and the New Deal Horse by L. M. Elliott 

1. In which book was a character’s name changed from Vulcan to Sunup? p. 301 

2. In which book did a character jump a fence just for fun? p. 134 

3. In which book was a character worried that she would lose her corn crop because there 
was no rain? p. 181 

4. In which book did characters find dandelion weeds, peaches, and quail eggs to eat? p. 
42, 44 

5. In which book did a character say that she and her sister were good workers and could 
help pick peaches? p. 79 

 

Control Freaks by J. E. Thomas 

1. In which book does a school cafeteria have six different kinds of lasagna for all the 
students’ dietary needs? p. 59 

2. In which book did teams have to create a team name that told something important 
about the group? chp. 12 

3. In which book did a character want to be nominated by his school to enter GadgetCon? 
chp. 1 

4. In which book did characters have to use their coding skills to find and correct a 
mistake in a line of code? chp. 29 



5. In which book did a character flick his/her retainer when challenged? (throughout the 
book) 

 

Dinged by Tommy Greenwald 

1. In which book did a character and his parents go to a college football game? chp. 13 

2. In which book was a character diagnosed with early-onset dementia? chp. 26 

3. In which book did a character and his father always work out together on Sunday 
mornings? chp. 11 

4. In which book did characters discuss an article that gave information about 
concussions and high school students? chp. 22 

5. In which book did boys throw a character’s phone back and forth to each other? chp. 
19 

 

Dogtown by Katherine Applegate and Gennifer Choldenko 

1. In which book were characters worried about being put on The List? P. 34 

2. In which book did characters love Reading Buddy days? P. 77 

3. In which book did characters celebrate because they had done their part to help 
Geraldine find her forever home? P. 153 

4. In which book did a character think that a boy smelled like buttered toast with 
toothpaste? P. 87 

5. In which book did characters work hard to get a locked door at a furniture store to 
open? P. 271 

 

Eagle Drums by Nasuģraq Rainey Hopson 

1. In which book did a lemming come to watch a character work? p. 97 

2. In which book did a character invite various people to a feast, drawing a map to show 
them where to go? p. 202 



3. In which book had a character’s two brothers disappeared into the mountains, leaving 
behind only a bow that had carvings of animals and places where those animals could be 
found? p. 6 

4. In which book was a character told only to talk to people in pairs at the places he’s 
being guided to? p. 168 

5. In which book did a character try to build a miniature model of a sod house? p. 144 

 

Farther Than the Moon by Lindsay Lackey 

1. In which book did a character volunteer to be in the first competition so that his 
instructors would remember him? chp. 8 

2. In which book did a character have a house like a museum filled with awards, plaques, 
trophies, medals, and photographs? chp. 37, p. 372 

3. In which book did a character have a brother with cerebral palsy? chp. 1 

4. In which book did a character think if he was good enough his grandparent would want 
to be part of the family? chp. 10, p. 110 

5. In which book did characters plan to spend four weeks getting scuba certified, taking 
intro courses to physics, geology, and astronomy, and competing in robotics tournaments? 
chp. 11 

 

Lasagna Means I Love You by Kate O’Shaughnessy 

1. In which book did a character often approach strangers to ask if they had any family 
stories or recipes they wanted to share? P. 133 

2. In which book did a character fall asleep while baking bread and wake up to the shriek 
of the smoke alarm? P. 37 

3. In which book was a character glad to find out that another character didn’t like fish so 
that it could be two against one? P. 82 

4. In which book did a character decide to open a pop-up restaurant for just one night? P. 
236 



5. In which book did a character get a PO box so she could get letters without giving out 
her personal address? P. 140 

 

My Especially Weird Week with Tess by Anna Woltz and David Colmer 

1. In which book did a character break his ankle after falling in a hole at the beach? chp. 
9 

2. In which book did a character say she wasn’t supposed to find out her father’s name 
until she was 18? chp. 6 

3. In which book does a character imagine a list of the most important people he’d save if 
a volcano erupted that included the three members of his family and the fourth person, 
somebody he just met recently? p. 154 

4. In which book did a character wait at a port to talk to a man before he got on a ferry to 
leave? chp. 30 

5. In which book go on a treasure hunt together using a map full of Xs? chp. 22  

 

No One Leaves the Castle by Christopher Healy 

1. did characters discover secret passageways that connected all of the rooms in a 
building? chp. 16 

2. In which book did a character dye her ginger hair black so she wouldn’t be known as a 
foreigner? chp. 16 

3. In which book did a character discover that an Emerald Axe had been stolen for the 
second time? chp. 6 

4. In which book did characters use cream puffs to discover a ferret’s den? chp. 23 

5. In which book was original artwork painted over to replace everyday objects with 
items that would gain the family more respect? chp. 28, p. 474 

 

Peril at Price Manor by Laura Parnum 

1. In which book did a character enjoy practicing screams and facial expressions from 
famous horror movie Scream Queens? p. 3 



2. In which book did several characters have a grayish-pink blob with tentacles covering 
much of their faces? p. 51 

3. In which book did characters have a roller-skating rink in their attic? p. 155 

4. In which book did a character turn off all the fog machines? p. 230 

5. In which book did a character have a difficult time running with a knight’s helmet on 
her head? p. 131 

 

Shinji Takahashi and the Mark of the Coatl by Julie Kagawa 

1. In which book did a character see his aunt fighting with two men when one of them hit 
her in the jaw? p. 35 

2. In which book did characters have to cut down vines and branches with machetes to 
make a path through the jungle? p. 187 

3. In which book did characters see snakes fall through holes in the ceiling? p. 218 

4. In which book did a character set a spider’s web on fire? p. 287 

5. In which book did characters take a tiny plane to Mexico City with people they hardly 
knew? p. 142 

 

Simon Sort of Says by Erin Bow 

1. In which book did characters live in a town that was surrounded by radio telescopes? 
chp. 1 

2. In which book does a character live on an angora goat farm and help her family shear 
the goats? chp. 11 

3. In which book does a character use flower-colored cupcake liners to sort their food? 
chp. 4, p. 51 

4. In which book did a character use a metronome to make sure he opened and closed a 
microwave to steady beats? chp. 23 

5. In which book did a character wrap himself in a blanket and lie under his bed to try to 
calm himself during a panic attack? chp. 13 



 

The Door of No Return by Kwame Alexander 

1. In which book did a character challenge his cousin to a swimming contest? p. 106 

2. In which book did a character think that a certain kind of red berries would help them 
grow taller? p. 151 

3. In which book did characters believe the river was cursed at nighttime? p. 22 

4. In which book did a character learn that the severed heads he had seen belonged to 
men trying to escape? p. 339 

5. In which book did characters play a game called Oware, where the goal was to capture 
the greatest number of stones possible? p. 81 

 

The Fire, the Water, and Maudie McGinn by Sally Pla 

1. In which book is a character worried that she started a fire by forgetting to blow a 
candle out? chp. 25 

2. In which book does a character’s mother have a YouTube channel called “Living with 
Grace”? chp. 6 

3. In which book did characters stay in a camper at a state campground because they had 
nowhere else to stay? chp. 5 

4. In which book do characters work together to clean up trash from the beach? chp. 31 

5. In which book did a character ask a lady to show her how to surf? chp. 16 

 

The Ghosts of Rancho Espanto by Adrianna Cuevas 

1. In which book did a character go to a ranch in New Mexico that had no cell phone 
service or internet? p. 13 

2. In which book did a character count on his fingers over and over to keep himself calm? 
(throughout the book) 

3. In which book did a character push a nightstand in front of his bedroom door to try to 
stay safe? p. 174 



4. In which book were characters stuck in a cave and decided to try to move rocks away 
from the opening so they could get free? p. 153 

5. In which book did a character claim to be a person from 2062? p. 209 

 

The Lost Year by Katherine Marsh 

1. In which book did a character feel guilty about her father’s heart attack? p. 63 and 193 

2. In which book did a character take her grandmother out of a nursing home to live with 
her during COVID? p. 29 

3. In which book did a character discover a letter from relatives that her father had hidden 
in a secret desk compartment? p. 164 

4. In which book did a character have her hair shaved off when she got to the Collector so 
she wouldn’t get lice? p. 251 

5. In which book did characters go to midnight Easter mass at the Orthodox church? p. 
153 

 

The Mona Lisa Vanishes by Nicholas Day 

1. did something that was missing become a tourist attraction? (The Louvre Reopens) 

2. In which book did a character work as an apprentice after he had shown a talent for 
drawing? (Florence, 1466) 

3. In which book did a character think an item was with the photographers and wasn’t 
really missing? (Brigadier Paupardin has a Very Bad Day) 

4. In which book did a character dissect human bodies so he could study and write about 
them in his notebooks? (Rome, 1513) 

5. did characters come by the thousands to see an object? (No Word Spoken but 
Gioconda) 

 

The Switch by Roland Smith 



1. In which book was the father of a character a zoo director who often brought zoo 
animals home with him? chp. 1 

2. In which book did a character keep hearing a dead girl’s voice in his head? Part 2 

3. In which book did a character see an airplane crash? chp. 3 

4. In which book did a character get through a fence by digging a hole & concealing it 
with a log? chp. 37 

5. In which book did a character think his uncles had been hit by tranquilizer darts? chp. 
22 

 

We Still Belong by Christine Day 

1. In which book were characters part of a Gamer Club at school? chp. 2 

2. In which book was a character excited to see the poem she had written published in the 
school newspaper? chp. 14 

3. In which book did characters go to a powwow being held at a high school? chp. 41 

4. In which book did a character and her mother live with her grandfather, her aunt and 
uncle, and baby cousin? chp. 8 

5. In which book was a character surprised to see a picture of a boy wearing a bracelet 
with purple and gold beads and letter blocks that spelled out TOLO? chp. 27 


